
 

Kilbirnie Recreation Centre Holiday Programme | Jan 2025 
101 Kilbirnie Cresent, Kilbirnie | To book phone 04 387 1491 or visit wellington.govt.nz/holidayprogrammes 

Monday 13 January Tuesday 14 January Wednesday 15 January Thursday 16 January Friday 17 January 

Parkour & Floor is Lava challenge 

Begin your day by learning the flow 
of parkour movement with 
specialized instructors, guiding you 
through a unique course designed 
to enhance your skills. Following 
this, test your agility and creativity 
with the "Floor is Lava" challenge, 
where participants can create their 
own obstacles using soft play 
equipment. 

Skateboarding skills & dodgeball 

Whether you're a beginner looking 
to get comfortable or an 
experienced skater wanting to learn 
advanced tricks, our specialised 
skate instructors can help you reach 
your goals. After the skate session, 
participants will have the chance to 
showcase their skills in a mini 
dodgeball tournament. 

Skating skills and games 

Join us for a fun-filled skating 
session featuring tutor-led games. 
Whether you prefer roller skates or 
rollerblades, come skate with us and 
enjoy a unique and exciting 
experience. Followed by some fun 
games after! 

Ball sports & Gymnastics 

Today we take on a variety of 
exciting sporting activities, including 
indoor football, basketball, 
volleyball, and more! This will be 
followed by learning gymnastics 
skills. Come and experience the fun 
of trying out different sports and 
challenge yourself in an engaging 
environment. 

 

Dodge and Chase 

Start your morning off some fun 
games of dodgeball to get your 
blood pumping. After that, challenge 
yourself with a thrilling round of 
chase tag in our next-level obstacle 
arena. 

 

Monday 20 January Tuesday 21 January Wednesday 22 January Thursday 23 January Friday 24 January 

Wellington Anniversary 

No programme. 

Skateboarding skills and trick 
competition 

Get ready to take your 

skateboarding skills to the next 

level. Learn new tricks and 

techniques, then showcase your 

abilities in a mini trick competition.  

KiRC Amazing race & team 
challenges 

Get ready for the KIRC Amazing 
Race! Form your teams and embark 
on a fun scavenger hunt to locate 
items scattered around Kilbirnie 
Recreation Centre, Kilbirnie Library, 
and Kilbirnie Park. After completing 
the hunt, return to the centre for a 
series of exciting team challenges.  
 

Racket and bat sports 

Join us for  some epic rallies in 
racket sports, including pickleball 
and badminton. Finishing up with 
some batting including nonstop 
cricket and softball! 

Skating mash-up & inflatables 

Get ready for some exciting skating 
games run by our experienced 
instructors. Afterwards, get ready for 
some inflatable fun and free play to 
finish off the week! 

Bring a packed lunch, water bottle, sunhat, shoes and socks every day.   

Feel free to bring your own skating equipment, otherwise equipment will be provided.  

 

 

 

 

 

Tawa Recreation Centre 
Tawa College, 
Duncan Street, Tawa 
For ages 5‒12 years 
To book phone 04 232 2260 

Ākau Tangi Sports Centre 
72 Kemp Street, 
Kilbirnie 
For ages 5‒14 years 
To book phone 04 830 0500 

Karori Recreation Centre 
251 Karori Road, 
Karori 
For ages 5-12 years 
To Book phone 04 476 8090 

 

Nairnville Recreation Centre 
Cnr Cockayne Road and Lucknow Terrace, 
Khandallah 
For ages 5‒14 years 
To book phone 04 479 2022 
 



 

 

Monday 27 January Tuesday 28 January Wednesday 29 January Thursday 30 January Friday 31 January 

Roller hockey skills and games 

Pop on your roller-skates and come 
along to learn some roller hockey 
skills. We’ll spend some time 
learning the basics and then you 
can put what you’ve learnt to the 
test in a game.  

Kilbirnie Ninja Warrior & quiz 
challenge 

Test your skills on Kilbirnie’s very 
own Ninja Warrior course. Jump, 
run and climb as fast as you can to 
see if you can set the record!  
Followed by a brain buster quiz 
challenge. 

Outdoor sports day 

Make the most of the sunshine by 
getting involved in our outdoor 
sports day! We will be playing a 
variety of sports including Ultimate 
Frisbee, Ki-O-Rahi and Capture the 
Flag. 

Wheels day 

Requested by popular demand get 
ready for our ultimate wheels day! 
Bring along your wheels of choice 
and get involved in some fun games 
before having some free play on the 
rink. 

 

Outdoor fun day 

Let’s end the summer holidays with 
a bang! We will start the session off 
with some fun outdoor games. Make 
sure you bring a towel and change 
of clothes as we finish the day with 
an epic water fight! 

 

 
 
Bookings open Monday 11 November 2024 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Nairnville Rec Centre Time Cost per day 

On-site day 8.30am-1pm $30 

Tawa Recreation Centre 
Tawa College, 
Duncan Street, Tawa 
For ages 5‒12 years 
To book phone 04 232 2260 

Ākau Tangi Sports Centre 
72 Kemp Street, 
Kilbirnie 
For ages 5‒14 years 
To book phone 04 830 0500 

Karori Recreation Centre 
251 Karori Road, 
Karori 
For ages 5-12 years 
To Book phone 04 476 8090 

 

Nairnville Recreation Centre 
Cnr Cockayne Road and Lucknow Terrace, 
Khandallah 
For ages 5‒14 years 
To book phone 04 479 2022 
 


